IDBI Trusteeship Services Ltd
CIN : U65991MH2001GOI131154 @ IDBI |trustee

Ref. No. /ITSL/OPR/2017-18/7022
December 01, 2017

To,

The Deputy General Manager

Securities and Exchange Board of India

Market Intermediaries Regulation & Supervision Department - III
Plot No. C4-A, “G’ Block, Bandra Kurla Complex, Bandra (East),
Mumbai ~ 400 051.

Kind Attn: Ms, Medha Sonparote

Dear Ma’am,

Sub: Asian Business Connections Private Limited (“Issuer”) - Intimation regarding delay in pavment
of interest/principal with respect to Listed, Secured, Non-convertible Debenture aggregating to Rs.
450 crores :

We are acting as a Debenture Trustee for Listed, Secured, Non-convertible Debenture (NCDs) aggregating
to Rs. 450 crores issued by the Issuer,

In this connection, we have to inform that the Issuer has delayed the payment of interest in relation to the
NCDs registered under ISIN: INES84V07018, which was due on 30t November, 2017 to 2™ December,
2017 as per the e-mail confirmation received from the issuer. (Copy enclosed).

This for your information and record.

The above information is submitted to your office as required under SEBI Circular No.
SEBI/HO/MIRSD/MIRSD3 /CIR/P/2017/72 dated the June 30, 2017.

Thanking you,

Yours faithfully,
For IDBI Trusteeship Services Limited

Authorised Signatory

Regd. Office : Asian Building, Ground Floor, 17, R. Kamani Marg, Ballard Estate, Mumbai - 400 001,
Tel. : 022-4080 7000 » Fax : 022-6631 1776 « Email : itsl@idbitrustee.com » response@idbitrustee.com
Website : www.idbitrustee.com



Renu Kamra

From: Prashant Vadnere <prashantvad nere@groupcarnival.com=>

Sent: 01 December 2017 13:37

To: Renu Kamra

Cc acd@groupcarnival.com; sanjiv.singh@groupcarniva|.com; Nikita Shah; Abhishek-y Bansal; Hetan Ashar; Bijal Patel
Subject: RE: Interest Calculation of 30th Nov 2017 - CRITICAL

For your consideration

From: Prashant Vadnere [mailto:prashant.vadnere@groupcarnival.com]

Sent: Thursday, November 30, 2017 7:59 PM

To: Hetan Ashar

Cc: acd@groupcarnival.com; sanjiv.singh@groupcarniva|.com; Nikita Shah; Rahul Chawla; skb@groupcarnival.com
Subject: RE: Interest Calculation of 30th Nov 2017 - CRITICAL

Dear Sir,

Due 10 some technical problem in our system, we dre not able to remit due interest payment today. We will pay due amount of interest on 2"° of December
2017.

We request you to kindly help us for the same.

Thank you,
Prashant
9021890671
Carnival Group

From: Hetan Ashar [mailto:hetan.ashar@db.com]

Sent: Thursday, November 30, 2017 6:21 PM

To: acd@groupcarnival.com

Cc: sanjiv.singh@groupcarnival.com; ‘Prashant Vadnere'; Nikita Shah; Rahul Chawla; skb@groupcarnival.com
Subject: RE: Interest Calculation of 30th Nov 2017 - CRITICAL

Dineshiji,




I'still await the status of the interest payment, which was due today. Please advise ASAP,

Best,
Hetan

From: Hetan Ashar

Sent: Thursday, November 30, 2017 5:34 PM

To: 'Nikita Shah' <nikita.shah@aoploverseas.com>

Cc: 'acd@groupcarnival.com' <acd@groupcarnival.com>; 'sanjiv.singh@groupcarnival.com' <sanjiv.singh@groupcarnival.com>; 'Prashant Vadnere'
<prashant.vadnere@groupcarnival.com>

Subject: RE: Interest Calculation of 30th Nov 2017

Has the interest payment been processed? Please confirm

Best,
Hetan

From: Hetan Ashar

Sent: Tuesday, November 28, 2017 12:26 PM

To: 'Nikita Shah' <nikita.shah@aoploverseas.com>

Ce: 'acd@groupcarnival.com' <acd@groupcarnival.com>; 'sanjiv.singh@groupcarnival.com' <sanjiv.singh@groupcarnival.com>; 'Prashant Vadnere'
<prashant.vadnere@groupcarnival.com>

Subject: RE: Interest Calculation of 30th Nov 2017

Enclosed is the corrected calculation.

Best,
Hetan

From: Nikita Shah {mailto:nikita.shah@aoploverseas.com]

Sent: Tuesday, November 28, 2017 12:21 PM

To: Hetan Ashar <hetan.ashar@db.com>

Cc: acd@groupcarnival.com; sanjiv.singh@groupcarnival.com: 'Prashant Vadnere' <prashant.vadnere@groupcarnival.com>
Subject: Interest Calculation of 30th Nov 2017

Dear Sir,

As discussed, PFA interest working for NCD issued by ABCPL.



Kindly confirm the same.

Thanks & Regards,
Nikita Shah
Carnival Group

This e-mail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this e-mail i_n
error) please notify the sender immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material
in this e-mail is strictly forbidden.

Privacy of communications

In order to monitor compliance with legal and regulatory obligations and our policies, procedures and compliance programs, we may
review emails and instant messages passing through our IT systems (including any personal data and customer information they
contain), and record telephone calls routed via our telephone systems. We will only do so in accordance with focal laws and regulations.
In some countries please refer to your local DB website for a copy of our Privacy Policy.

Please refer to https://db.com/disclosures for additional EU corporate and regulatory disclosures.

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this e-mail and any attachment(s) are confidential and intended solely for the named recipient(s) only. This message and its attachments contain
confidential information and may also contain legally privileged information. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or authorized to receive for addressee),
you may not copy or deliver any part of this message or its attachments to anyone or use any part of this message or its attachments. Rather, you should permanently
delete this message and its attachments (and all copies) from your system and kindly notify the sender by reply e-mail at it support@groupcarnival.com. Any views or
opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and may not necessarily reflect the opinions of CARNIVAL GROUP or its affiliates. It shali not attach any
liability on the originator or CARNIVAL GROUP or its affiliates. Any form of reproduction, dissemination, copying, disclosure, modification, distribution and / or publication
of this message without the prior written consent of the author of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. All reasonable precautions have been taken to ensure no viruses are
present in this e-mail. Before opening any mail and attachments please check them for viruses and defect(s). Email communications are not private and no warranty is
made that e-mail communications are timely, secure or free from computer virus or other defect(s).




